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4814 Henry Street  Norton Shores, Michigan 49441 www.nortonshores.org

April 8, 2019

Council Meeting of April 16, 2019
Subject: Purchase Authorization
Bituminous Asphalt Mix

The Honorable Mayor
and
Members of the City Council

Ladies and Gentlemen:

Three bids were received March 26, 2019 for bituminous asphalt mixtures as follows:

Asphalt Asphalt Michigan Unique 2018 Prices
Mixtures Paving, Inc., Paving & Paving
Muskegon, Ml Materials Materials
Grand Rapids, Cleveland,
Ml OH
2019 3B-3C $68.50/ton $67.50/ton No Bid $63.50/ton
2019 4B-4C $69.50/ton $68.00/ton No Bid $64.50/ton
2019 13A $69.50/ton $66.50/ton No Bid $64.50/ton
Base
2019 13A Top $69.50/ton $67.50/ton No Bid $64.50/ton
2019 36A $69.50/ton $68.00/ton No Bid $64.50/ton
2019 Asphalt $69.50/ton No bid No Bid $64.50/ton
Curb Mix
2019 Court $69.50/ton No Bid No Bid $64.50/ton
Mix
2019 Cold $110.00/ton No Bid $107.45/ton  $107.45/ton
Patch CP1

The bids were analyzed and found to be in order and in compliance with City

specifications.
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Norton Shores will not discriminate against any individual or group because of race, sex, religion, age,
national origin, color, marital status, handicap or polifical beliefs or other legally protected characteristics.
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Approval of the attached resolution will authorize the purchase of bituminous asphalt
mixtures on an as needed basis from the respective low bidders when transportation is
considered.

Respectfully submitted,
\/\/\\/\,\L/(/ » N, \/‘/\

Mark C. Meyers
City Administrator

GAB/sr
Attachment



RESOLUTION
WHEREAS, three bids were taken for the purchase of bituminous asphalt mixtures,
WHEREAS, the bids were found to be in order:

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED that the bid be awarded to the low bidder, when
transportation is considered as follows:

Asphalt Paving, Inc. of Muskegon, Michigan

3B-3C S 68.50/ton
4B-4C S 69.50/ton
13A Top S 69.50/ton
13A Base S 69.50/ton
36A S 69.50/ton
Asphalt Curb Mix  $ 69.50/ton
Court Mix S 69.50/ton

Unique Paving Materials of Cleveland, Ohio

Cold Patch CP 1 $107.45/ton

At a regular meeting of the City Council of the City of Norton Shores, held at the Norton Shores
Branch Library, 705 Seminole Road, on the 16" day of April, 2019 the foregoing resolution was
moved for adoption by Council Member. The motion was supported by Council Member.

Ayes:

Nays:

Excused:

Resolution declared adopted/denied.

Shelly Stibitz, City Clerk



